
Slide: Welcome 
(Start kid’s countdown once all classes are present.) 

Hey kids! Welcome to Kid’s Church. I’m so glad you could be here today.  

Slide: Series Intro 
Today we are going to take a look at a really awesome story from Jesus’s life. In this story 
Jesus meets a lady who had made some big mistakes in her life. Have you ever made a big 
mistake? (allow kids to answer). Me, too! Well, Jesus has a pretty important lesson to teach us 
about our mistakes! 

We’ll learn more about that in a few minutes, but first let’s stand and sing a song! 

Song 

Another Day 

Good job! I think God loves hearing all your voices praising him! Now let’s say our Big Idea 
together. 

Slide: Big Idea 
All together:  

Jesus wants a relationship with everyone, no matter what. (Repeat) 

Video 
Play lesson video. 

Slide: Recap 
So, what did we learn from the video today? Let’s review... 

• Why did Jesus sit down at the well? (he was tired) 

• Why did the woman have no friends? (she had made a lot of mistakes) 

• True or False: Some mistakes are too big for Jesus to forgive. (F) 

There are no mistakes that are too big for Jesus to forgive! The lady he met at the well had 
made a lot of mistakes. She had done things that made all of the other people in village 
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dislike her. Lucky for her, she met Jesus that day. He told her he that he had come into the 
world to forgive the sins of everyone and to make them right with God. Her life was changed 
that day! She went from being sad, lonely, and ashamed of the things she had done to being 
excited and hopeful because she was forgiven through Jesus! 

That reminds me of our memory verse. Let’s all stand and say it together. 

Slide: Memory Verse 
”We (point to self) are made right with God (point up) by placing our faith in Jesus Christ 
(hands over heart). And this is true for everyone (motion to kids) who believes no matter who 
we are (shake finger “no”).” Romans 3:22 (Repeat) 

Isn’t that amazing! God loves us no matter who we are. This was especially true in the story 
we learned about today. The woman Jesus met at the well was a Samaritan woman and Jesus 
was a Jewish man. In those days it was pretty uncommon for those two types of people to 
talk! First, because Samaritans and Jews weren’t friends and second, men didn’t typically 
speak to women. Now, Jesus knew all of that but he still wanted this woman to know that he 
loved her and would forgive her of all of her mistakes. 

This is true for us, too. Jesus came to die for our sins so that we could be forgiven for all of 
the mistakes we’ve made. If you want to have that relationship with him, but haven’t asked 
him into your heart, talk to a parent or teacher about it today. They would love to help you 
understand more about what that means and how you can take that step! 

Now let’s all stand and sing one last song together. 

Song 

Happy Day 

Okay, let’s all say the Big Idea together one last time! 

Slide: Big Idea 

Jesus wants a relationship with everyone, no matter what. (Repeat) 

Slide: Let’s Pray 
Pray and release the kids to small group.
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